Waterworks Supplies Bid Rankings

Low Bid by Vendor for Each Item Group

ltem Farmsworth FERGUSON |Arizona Water| Dana Kepner
Grouping | Wholesale Co. | WATERWORKS [Works Supply Co. Inc
One 11,271.54
Two 2,667.50
Three 6,994.74
Four 133.08
Five 6,247.94
Six 232.98
Seven 5,232.99
Eight 5,983.27
Nine 27,593.00
Ten 10,244.78
Eleven 1,199.00
Twelve 33,292.11
Thirteen 516.22
Fourteen 7,936.51
Fifteen 2,679.39
Sixteen 17,932.60
Seventeen 620.76
Eighteen 21,982.31
Nineteen 1,190.00
Twenty 29,866.73
Grand totals $5,346.89 $65,067.07 $59,717.24 $52,414.71




Waterworks Supplies Bid Rankings

Farmsworth Wholesale Co. Ferguson Waterworks Arizona Water Works Supply Dana Kepner Co. Inc
Grouping Item No. Description Quantity | Unit Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 Adaptor Meter 3/4"x1", No. A24 48 EA 6.81 326.88 6.81 326.88 6.64 318.72 14.00 672.00
2 Bend 90 Brass 1" 72 EA 3.74 269.28 4.67 336.24 3.61 259.92 4.00 288.00
One 3 Bend 45 MJ 6" CI 6 EA 44.27 265.62 43.99 263.94 40.66 243.96 27.85 167.10
4 Bend 90 MJ 6" ClI 10 EA 54.40 544.00 54.06 540.60 49.96 499.60 55.65 556.50
5 Bend 45 MJ 8" ClI 4 EA 64.53 258.12 64.13 256.52 59.27 237.08 66.00 264.00
6 Bend 90 MJ 8" CI 6 EA 80.00 480.00 79.50 477.00 73.47 440.82 81.85 491.10
7 Box Meter #2 - Concrete 100 EA 27.60 2,760.00 25.19 2,519.00 23.14 2,314.00 25.80 2,580.00
8 Box Meter #2 - Concrete Extension 100 EA 29.43 2,943.00 25.19 2,519.00 23.14 2,314.00 25.80 2,580.00
9 Box Lid #2 - Scott Lid 100 EA 42.38 4,238.00 41.37 4,137.00 37.99 3,799.00 42.30 4,230.00
10 Box Top Concrete #4 4 EA 37.13 148.52 35.67 142.68 32.76 131.04 36.50 146.00
11 Box Extension Concrete #4 4 EA 39.09 156.36 35.67 142.68 32.76 131.04 36.50 146.00
12 Box Lid #4 - Scott Lid 4 EA 77.56 310.24 75.72 302.88 89.94 359.76 77.45 309.80
13 Bushing 1" X 3/4" - Brass 50 EA 2.20 110.00 2.58 129.00 1.90 95.00 2.20 110.00
14 Bushing 2" X 3/4" - Brass 4 EA 8.28 33.12 10.04 40.16 7.40 29.60 10.90 43.60
15 Cap 3/4" - Brass 25 EA 1.77 44.25 2.06 51.50 1.53 38.25 1.73 43.25
16 Cap 1"- Brass 25 EA 2.98 74.50 3.23 80.75 2.39 59.75 2.87 71.75
F——— 12,961.89 12,065,83| rtrrmmmmiices 11,071 54| ertosmmmmmsies 12,699.10
Two 17 Cap Debris - D-457 50 EA 47.28 2,364.00 50.00 2,500.00{No Bid No Bid 54.40 2,720.00
18 Cap SDR-35 PVC 6" 50 EA 6.07 303.50 6.31 315.50|No Bid No Bid 4.40 220.00
Ioisioioeioioioioieioioioiei 2,667.50 2,815.50 2,940.00
19 Clamp Bell Leak 4", Ford DIP 6 EA 162.67 967.02 80.45 482.70 74.38 284.28 49.95 299.70
20 Clamp Bell Leak 6", Ford DIP 18 EA 179.57 3,232.26 96.97 1,745.46 52.18 939.24 55.00 990.00
Three 21 Clamp Bell Leak 8", Ford DIP 12 EA 248.96 2,987.52 113.11 1,357.32 72.17 866.04 76.05 912.50
21 Clamp Bell Leak 10", Ford DIP 6 EA 328.03 1,968.18 145.70 874.20 86.89 521.34 95.33 571.98
22 Clamp 3/4" X 3", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 50 EA 21.61 1,080.50 10.54 527.00 9.30 465.00 9.00 490.00
22 Clamp 3/4" X 6", Meuller 230 Series or Equal 50 EA 42.53 2,126.50 17.83 891.50 19.68 984.00 20.75 1,037.50
23 Clamp 1" X 3", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 50 EA 22.66 1,133.00 11.02 551.00 9.30 465.00 10.40 520.00
23 Clamp 1" X 6", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 50 EA 45.01 2,250.50 18.90 945.00 19.68 984.00 20.90 1,045.00
24 Clamp 1-1/4" X 3", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 12 EA 23.41 280.92 11.60 139.20 9.85 118.20 10.40 124.80
24 Clamp 1-14" X 6", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 6 EA 45.80 274.80 23.52 141.12 19.81 237.72 21.30 127.80
25 Clamp 1-1/2" X 3", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 12 EA 23.41 280.92 11.87 142.44 9.85 118.20 10.95 131.40
25 Clamp 1-1/2" X 6", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 12 EA 45.80 549.60 24.94 299.28 19.81 237.72 21.55 258.60
26 Clamp 2" X 3", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 24 EA 25.97 623.28 14.34 344.16 11.29 270.96 11.89 285.36
26 Clamp 2" X 6", Mueller 230 Series or Equal 24 EA 47.66 1,143.84 28.70 688.80 20.96 503.04 22.10 530.40
F——— 18,898.84 9,129,18|##trmmmmmmiices 6,004, 74| krrosmmmmme 7,325.04

Four 27 Clamp 2-1/2" X 3", Mueller 200 Series or Equal 6 EA [No Bid No Bid 11.09 66.54 30.03 180.18[No Bid No Bid

28 Clamp 2-1/2" X 6", Mueller 200 Series or Equal 6 EA |No Bid No Bid 11.09 66.54 30.03 180.18|No Bid No Bid

133,08 rrrrrtirrttree 360.36

29 Clamp 2.35 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 12 EA 71.17 854.04 37.78 453.36 30.03 360.36 31.65 379.80
Five 30 Clamp 2.35 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 6 EA 117.66 705.96 48.83 292.98 47.54 285.24 50.10 300.60
31 Clamp 2.70 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 24 EA 117.66 2,823.84 54.28 1,302.72 48.32 1,159.68 50.95 1,222.60
32 Clamp 2.97 X 6", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 36 EA 71.17 2,562.12 31.62 1,138.32 35.48 1,277.28 37.40 1,346.40




Five

Six

Seven

Eight

Nine

Waterworks Supplies Bid Rankings

Farmsworth Wholesale Co.

Ferguson Waterworks

Arizona Water Works Supply

Dana Kepner Co. Inc

Quantity | Unit Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
33 Clamp 3.46 X 6", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 20 EA 85.34 1,706.80 28.19 563.80 35.48 709.60 37.40 748.00
34 Clamp 3.73 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 18 EA 135.98 2,447.64 34.95 629.10 55.38 996.84 58.35 1,050.00
35 Clamp 4.45 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 18 EA 93.09 1,675.62 38.83 698.94 42.47 767.46 44.75 805.50
36 Clamp 4.74 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 12 EA 93.09 1,117.08 38.83 465.96 39.77 477.24 41.90 502.80
37 Clamp 4.95 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal EA 93.09 558.54 38.83 232.98 39.77 238.62 41.90 251.40
38 Clamp 4.95 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 147.07 588.28 59.20 236.80 53.94 215.76 56.85 227.40
39 Clamp 5.20 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal EA 93.09 558.54 38.83 232.98 39.77 238.62 41.90 251.40
— 15,598.46 6,047.94|rrrrmkrrrmmis 6,726.70 | ermmmkcrnome 7,085.90
40 Clamp 5.66 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 6 EA |No Bid No Bid 38.83 232.98 39.77 238.62 41.90 251.40
e N . 251.40
41 Clamp 5.94 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 110.44 441.76 45.58 182.32 40.72 162.88 42.90 171.60
42 Clamp 5.94 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 176.71 706.84 70.05 280.20 65.37 261.48 68.90 275.60
43 Clamp 6.34 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 110.44 441.76 45.58 182.32 40.72 162.88 42.90 171.60
44 Clamp 6.34 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 176.71 706.84 70.05 280.20 65.37 261.48 68.90 255.60
45 Clamp 6.55 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 110.44 441.76 45.58 182.32 40.72 162.88 42.90 171.60
46 Clamp 6.55 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 176.71 706.84 70.05 280.20 65.37 261.48 68.90 275.60
47 Clamp 6.84 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 6 EA 110.44 662.64 45.58 273.48 41.62 249.72 43.85 263.10
48 Clamp 6.84 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 176.71 706.84 70.05 280.20 66.60 266.40 70.20 280.80
49 Clamp 6.84 X 15", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 202.85 811.40 80.36 321.44 73.60 294.40 77.55 310.20
50 Clamp 6.84 X 30", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 1 EA 427.74 427.74 175.77 175.77 162.62 162.62 171.35 171.35
51 Clamp 7.04 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 6 EA 110.44 662.64 45.58 273.48 41.62 249.72 43.85 263.10
52  |Clamp 7.04 X 15", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 3 EA 202.85 608.55 80.36 241.08 73.60 220.80 82.00 246.00
53 Clamp 7.22 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 6 EA 110.44 662.64 45.58 273.48 41.62 249.72 43.85 263.10
54  |Clamp 7.22 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 4 EA 176.71 706.84 70.05 280.20 66.60 266.40 70.20 280.80
55 Clamp 7.22 X 15", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 3 EA 202.85 608.55 80.36 241.08 73.60 220.80 77.55 232.65
56 Clamp 7.22 X 30", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 2 EA 427.74 855.48 175.77 351.54 162.62 325.84 171.35 342.70
57 Clamp 8.36 X 12, Mueller 500 Series or Equal 3 EA 207.91 623.73 83.29 249.87 70.38 211.14 74.20 222.60
58 Clamp 8.99 X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 3 EA 129.65 388.95 59.68 179.04 43.93 131.79 46.30 138.90
59 Clamp 8.99 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 2 EA 207.91 415.82 83.29 166.58 70.38 140.76 74.20 148.40
60 Clamp 8.99 X 24", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 1 EA 382.86 382.86 173.05 173.05 114.60 114.60 120.75 120.75
61 Clamp 9.25.X 7.5", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 2 EA 129.65 259.30 59.68 119.36 44.94 89.88 47.40 94.80
62 Clamp 9.25 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 2 EA 207.91 415.82 83.29 166.58 72.02 144.04 75.90 151.80
63 Clamp 9.40 X 12", Mueller 500 Series or Equal 2 EA 207.91 415.82 83.29 166.58 72.02 144.04 75.90 151.80
—— 13,061.42 5,300,37 | rmmkernnmie 5,030, |errmktrrnmiie 5,507.25
64 Coupling Hymax 4.25-5.63 Range 8 EA 157.67 1,216.36 129.29 1,034.32|No Bid No Bid 158.00 1,264.00
65  |Coupling Hymax 6.42-7.68 Range 12 EA 205.99 2,471.88 170.70 2,048.40|No Bid No Bid 208.00 2,496.00
66 Coupling Hymax 8" 6 EA 233.27 1,399.62 193.31 1,159.86|No Bid No Bid 236.00 1,416.00
67 |Coupling Hymax 10" 7 EA 275.22 1,926.54 248.67 1,740.69|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
P —— 7,014.40 5,983.27
68 Mega-Lug Acc Set 4" DIP 8 EA 21.80 174.40 21.76 174.08 20.57 164.56 23.10 184.80
69 Mega-Lug Acc Set 4" PVC 16 EA 24.07 385.12 25.20 403.20 23.97 383.52 26.40 422.40
70 |Mega Lug Acc Set 6" DIP 36 EA 26.41 950.76 26.37 949.32 25.20 907.20 27.65 995.40
71 Mega-Lug Acc Set 6" PVC 12 EA 29.50 354.00 31.50 378.00 30.06 360.72 33.00 396.00
72 Mega-Lug Acc Set 8" DIP 12 EA 36.98 443.76 36.92 443.04 35.47 425.64 38.70 464.40
73 Mega-Lug Acc Set 8" C-900 10 EA 40.87 408.70 43.07 430.70 41.33 413.30 45.10 451.00




Nine

Waterworks Supplies Bid Rankings

Farmsworth Wholesale Co.

Ferguson Waterworks

Arizona Water Works Supply

Dana Kepner Co. Inc

Quantity | Unit Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
74 Mega-Lug Acc Set 10" DIP 6 EA 53.12 318.72 53.04 318.24 50.15 300.90 55.55 33.30
75 |Mega-Lug Acc Set 10" PVC 4 EA 72.86 291.44 75.23 300.92 70.20 280.80 78.80 315.20
76 Mega-Lug Acc Set 12" DIP 6 EA 71.98 431.88 71.86 431.16 69.41 416.46 75.25 451.50
77 Mega-Lug Acc Set 12" PVC 6 EA 76.89 461.34 78.82 472.92 74.26 445.56 82.55 495.30
78 Mega-Lug Acc Set 14" DIP 4 EA 91.60 366.40 98.09 392.36 95.48 381.92 102.70 410.80
79  |Mega-Lug Acc Set 18" DIP 4 EA 167.46 669.84 175.58 702.32 165.84 663.36 183.95 735.80
80 Meter Setter w/Check Valve 3/4" - Ford VBH72-9W-11-33 50 EA 76.95 3,847.50 77.69 3,884.50 73.81 3,690.50 81.70 4,085.00
81  |Meter Setter w/Check Valve 1" - Ford VBH74-12W-11-44 100 EA 138.23 13,823.00 139.59 13,958.60 132.60 13,260.00 146.80 14,680.00
82 Meter Setter w/Check Valve 1-1/2" - Ford VBH76-12W-11-66 6 EA 468.89 2,813.34 473.83 2,842.98 425.22 2,551.32 448.10 2,688.60
83 |Meter Setter w/Check Valve 2" - Ford VBH77-12W-11.77 6 EA 495.36 2,972.16 500.58 3,003.48 491.28 2,947.68 517.70 3,106.20
P — 28,712.36 20,085.82| +mmmiikiris 27,593, 44| rrerenmmiics 29,915.70
84 Nipple Brass 3/4" Close 50 EA 1.59 79.50 1.66 83.00 1.40 70.00{No Bid No Bid
85 Nipple Brass 3/4"x2" 36 EA 2.00 72.00 2.09 75.24 1.78 64.08[No Bid No Bid
86 |Nipple Brass 3/4"x2-1/2" 24 EA 2.32 55.68 2.43 58.32 2.06 49.44[No Bid No Bid
87 Nipple Brass 3/4"x3" 36 EA 2.68 96.48 2.80 100.80 2.38 85.68|No Bid No Bid
88  |Nipple Brass 3/4"x3-1/2" 24 EA 2.99 71.76 3.14 75.36 2.65 63.60|No Bid No Bid
89 Nipple Brass 3/4"x4" 36 EA 3.49 125.64 3.65 131.40 3.08 110.88[No Bid No Bid
90  |Nipple Brass 3/4"x4-1/2" 24 EA 3.79 90.96 3.97 95.28 3.36 80.64|No Bid No Bid
91 Nipple Brass 3/4"x5" 48 EA 4.19 201.12 4.38 210.24 3.71 178.08[No Bid No Bid
92 |Nipple Brass 3/4"x5-1/2" 24 EA 458 109.92 4.79 114.96 4.02 96.48|No Bid No Bid
93 Nipple Brass 3/4"x6" 72 EA 5.10 367.20 5.33 383.76 4.50 324.00|No Bid No Bid
94 |Nipple Brass 3/4"x6-1/2" 24 EA 5.97 143.28 6.25 150.00 5.93 142.32|No Bid No Bid
95 Nipple Brass 3/4"x7" 24 EA 5.97 143.28 6.25 150.00 5.93 142.32|No Bid No Bid
96 |Nipple Brass 3/4"x7-1/2" 24 EA 6.72 161.28 7.85 188.40 5.93 142.32|No Bid No Bid
97 Nipple Brass 3/4"x8" 24 EA 6.72 161.28 7.95 190.80 5.93 142.32|No Bid No Bid
98 Nipple Brass 3/4"x8-1/2" 24 EA 7.44 178.56 8.10 194.40 6.51 156.24[No Bid No Bid
99 Nipple Brass 3/4"x9" 36 EA 7.44 267.84 8.35 300.60 6.51 234.36{No Bid No Bid
100 [Nipple Brass 3/4"x9-1/2" 24 EA 8.21 197.04 8.88 213.12 7.08 169.92|No Bid No Bid
101 Nipple Brass 3/4"x10" 36 EA 8.21 295.56 8.89 323.28 7.08 260.28[No Bid No Bid
102 |Nipple Brass 3/4"x10-1/2" 24 EA 8.96 215.04 9.66 231.84 7.96 191.04|No Bid No Bid
103 Nipple Brass 3/4"x11" 36 EA 8.96 322.56 9.86 354.96 8.60 309.60(No Bid No Bid
104 |Nipple Brass 3/4"x11-1/2" 24 EA 9.77 234.48 10.40 249.60 8.60 206.40|No Bid No Bid
105 Nipple Brass 3/4"x12" 72 EA 9.77 703.44 10.70 770.40 8.60 619.20(No Bid No Bid
106 |Nipple Brass 1" close 36 EA 2.34 84.24 2.45 88.20 2.08 74.88[No Bid No Bid
107 Nipple Brass 1"x2" 36 EA 2.89 104.04 3.02 108.72 2.56 92.16{No Bid No Bid
108 [Nipple Brass 1"x2-1/2" 24 EA 3.37 80.88 3.53 84.72 2.97 71.28|No Bid No Bid
109 Nipple Brass 1"x3" 36 EA 3.88 139.68 4.06 146.16 3.43 123.48[No Bid No Bid
110 Nipple Brass 1"x3-1/2" 24 EA 4.49 107.76 4.70 112.80 3.98 95.52|No Bid No Bid
111 Nipple Brass 1"x4" 50 EA 5.06 253.00 5.29 264.50 4.46 223.00{No Bid No Bid
112 Nipple Brass 1"x4-1/2" 26 EA 5.63 146.38 5.89 153.14 4.48 129.48[No Bid No Bid
113 Nipple Brass 1"x5" 36 EA 6.23 224.28 6.52 234.72 5.49 197.64[No Bid No Bid
114 Nipple Brass 1"x5-1/2" 36 EA 6.82 245.52 7.14 257.04 6.01 216.36{No Bid No Bid
115 Nipple Brass 1"x6" 48 EA 7.43 356.64 7.78 373.44 6.57 315.36|No Bid No Bid
116  |Nipple Brass 1" x 7" 36 EA 8.69 312.84 9.09 327.24 8.74 314.64|No Bid No Bid
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Eleven
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Waterworks Supplies Bid Rankings

Farmsworth Wholesale Co. Ferguson Waterworks Arizona Water Works Supply Dana Kepner Co. Inc
Quantity | Unit Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
117 Nipple Brass 1"x8" 48 EA 9.92 476.16 10.38 498.24 8.74 419.52|No Bid No Bid
118 Nipple Brass 1" x 9" 48 EA 11.07 531.36 11.58 555.84 10.84 520.32[No Bid No Bid
119 |Nipple Brass 1" x 10" 48 EA 12.28 589.44 12.90 619.20 10.84 520.32|No Bid No Bid
120 Nipple Brass1"x12" 72 EA 14.64 1,054.08 15.40 1,108.80 12.89 928.08[No Bid No Bid
121 Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 2" 6 EA 4.94 29.64 5.17 31.02 4.35 26.10{No Bid No Bid
122 Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 2-1/2" 6 EA 5.92 35.52 60.19 37.14 5.23 31.38|No Bid No Bid
123 |Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 3" 6 EA 6.80 40.80 7.12 42.72 5.99 35.94|No Bid No Bid
124 Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 3-1/2" 6 EA 7.81 46.86 8.17 49.02 6.88 41.28|No Bid No Bid
125  |Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 4" 6 EA 8.80 53.16 9.27 55.62 7.81 46.86(No Bid No Bid
126 Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 4-1/2" 6 EA 9.96 41.76 10.42 62.52 8.79 52.74|No Bid No Bid
127 Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 5" 6 EA 11.01 66.06 11.52 69.12 9.71 58.26(No Bid No Bid
128 Nipple Brass 1-1/2" X 5-1/2" 6 EA 12.06 72.36 12.61 75.66 10.61 63.66[No Bid No Bid
129  |Nipple Brass 1-1/2" x 6" 6 EA 13.09 78.54 13.70 82.20 11.52 69.12|No Bid No Bid
130 Nipple Brass 2" X Close 12 EA 6.99 83.88 7.32 87.84 6.19 74.28|No Bid No Bid
131 |Nipple Brass 2" x 2 -1/2" 12 EA 7.56 90.72 7.90 94.80 6.66 79.92|No Bid No Bid
132 Nipple Brass 2" x 3" 12 EA 8.71 104.52 9.12 109.44 7.66 91.92|No Bid No Bid
133 |Nipple Brass 2" x 4" 12 EA 11.40 136.80 11.92 143.04 10.04 120.48|No Bid No Bid
134 Nipple Brass 2" X 5" 12 EA 14.09 169.08 14.74 176.88 12.44 149.28[No Bid No Bid
135  |Nipple Brass 2" X 6" 12 EA 16.83 201.96 17.60 211.20 17.83 177.96|No Bid No Bid
136 Nipple Brass 2" X 7" 12 EA 19.68 236.16 20.60 247.20 19.77 237.24[No Bid No Bid
137 _ |Nipple Brass 2" X 8" 12 EA 22.44 269.28 23.58 282.96 19.77 237.24|No Bid No Bid
138 Nipple Brass 2" x 12" 12 EA 32.44 389.28 34.88 418.56 29.22 350.64|No Bid No Bid
139  |Nipple Brass 2-1/2" X Close 12 EA 18.25 219.00 19.30 231.60 18.27 219.24|No Bid No Bid
[ ——— 11,365.58 12,087.06 | #rsssssssinininis 10,244.78
140  |Paint #20 Can Upside Marking Blue 300 EA 4.20 1,260.00 3.50 1,050.00 2.29 687.00 3.50 1,050.00
141 Paint #20 Can Upside Marking White 200 EA 4.20 840.00 3.50 700.00 2.29 458.00 3.50 700.00
142 |Paint #20 Can Upside Marking Black 24 EA 4.20 100.80 3.50 84.00 2.29 54.00 3.50 84.00
[ ——— 2,200.80 1,834.00 |Frrmmmrmrmmsmrines 1,199.00 |srwmrmmmrmmsmrises 1,834.00
143  |Pipe Soft Copper K 3/4" 500 LF 7.80 3,900.00; 490.00 2,450.00(No Bid No Bid 4.45 2,225.00,
144 Pipe Soft Copper K 1" 1000 LF 10.16 10,160.00; 634.00 6,340.00{No Bid No Bid 5.80 5,800.00
145  |Pipe Soft Copper K 1-1/2" 200 LF 17.25 3,450.00 1,060.00 2,120.00(No Bid No Bid 9.70 1,940.00
146 Pipe Soft Copper K 2" 200 LF 27.50 5,500.00 1,706.00 3,412.00{No Bid No Bid 16.75 3,350.00
147  |Pipe STD Glav. Steel 1-1/4" 21 LF 1.70 35.70 719.00 150.99|No Bid No Bid 2.36 49.56
148 Pipe STD Galv. Steel 1-1/2" 40 LF 2.24 89.60 860.00 344.00|No Bid No Bid 2.84 113.60
149 |Pipe STD Glav. Steel 2" 80 LF 2.74 219.20 1,153.00 922.40|No Bid No Bid 3.80 304.00
150 Pipe STD Glav. Steel 2-1/2" 21 LF 4.34 91.14 1,890.00 396.90|No Bid No Bid 5.95 124.95
151 |Pipe DIP 3" MJ, Class 350 40 LF 20.00 800.00 19.90 796.00|No Bid No Bid 18.20 728.00
152 Pipe DIP 4" MJ, Class 350 200 LF 19.37 3,874.00 19.90 3,980.00{No Bid No Bid 17.60 3,520.00
153 |Pipe DIP 6" MJ, Class 350 500 LF 19.37 9,685.00, 22.05 11,025.00|No Bid No Bid 17.60 8,800.00;
154 Pipe DIP 8" MJ, Class 350 100 LF 27.50 2,750.00 30.65 3,065.00{No Bid No Bid 25.00 2,500.00
155 |Pipe DIP 10" MJ, Class 350 60 LF 36.25 2,175.00, 39.79 2,387.40(No Bid No Bid 32.95 1,977.00
156 Pipe DIP 12" MJ, Class 350 40 LF 46.25 1,850.00 50.00 2,000.00{No Bid No Bid 42.00 1,680.00
157 |Pipe PVC 6", SDR-35 100 LF 217 217.00 1.89 189.00|No Bid No Bid 1.80 180.00
foiceleioioioioieioioioieisoiole 44,796.64 39,578.69 33,292.11
Farmsworth Wholesale Co. Ferguson Waterworks Arizona Water Works Supply Dana Kepner Co. Inc
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Quantity | Unit Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

158 Plug Threaded 3/4", Brass NPT 24 EA 1.72 41.28 1.71 41.04 1.39 33.36/No Bid No Bid
159  |Plug Threaded 1", Brass NPT 24 EA 2.28 54.72 2.26 54.24] 1.81 43.44[No Bid No Bid
160 Plug Threaded 1-1/4", Brass NPT 6 EA 3.39 20.34 3.48 20.88 2.72 16.32|No Bid No Bid
161 |Plug Threaded 1-1/2", Brass NPT 10 EA 4.07 40.70 4.28 42.80 3.43 34.30|No Bid No Bid
162 Plug Threaded 2", Brass NPT 72 EA 6.81 490.32 6.98 502.56 5.40 388.80|No Bid No Bid

—— 647.36 R . 516.2
163 Plug MJ 4", CP DI C153 3 EA 14.40 43.20 14.31 42.93 13.23 39.69 14.75 44.25
164 Plug MJ 6", CP DI C153 3 EA 27.20 81.60 21.73 65.19 24.98 74.94 27.85 83.55
165 Plug MJ 8", CP DI C153 2 EA 41.07 82.14 40.81 81.62 37.72 75.44 42.00 84.00
166 |Plug MJ 10", CP DI C153 3 EA 76.27 228.81 75.79 227.37 70.04 210.12 78.00 234.00
167 Plug MJ Tapped 4"X 2", CP DI C153 2 EA 27.73 55.46 27.56 55.12 25.47 50.94 28.40 56.80
168 |Plug MJ Tapped 6"X 2", CP DI C153 6 EA 40.53 243.18 40.28 241.68 37.23 223.38 41.45 248.70
169 Plug MJ Tapped 8"X 2", CP DI C153 2 EA 54.40 108.80 54.06 108.12 49.96 99.92 55.65 111.30
170 |Saddle 4" X 3/4" 4.74-5.32 2 EA 61.42 122.84 61.43 122.86 58.29 116.58 63.25 126.50
171 Saddle 4" x 1" 4.74 - 5.32 4 EA 61.42 245.68 61.43 245.72 58.29 233.16 63.25 253.00
172 |Saddle 4'x 1" 4.74-5.32 4 EA 61.42 245.68 61.43 245.72 58.29 233.16 63.25 253.00
173 Saddle 4" X 1-1/2" 4.74 - 5.32 2 EA 71.63 143.26 71.65 143.30 67.98 135.96 73.75 147.50
174  |Saddle 4" X 2" 4.74-5.32 2 EA 77.98 155.96 77.99 155.98 74.00 148.00 80.30 160.60
175 Saddle 6" X 3/4" 6.84 - 7.45 8 EA 72.34 578.72 72.36 578.88 68.66 549.28 74.50 596.00
176 |Saddle 6" X 1" 6.84-7.45 12 EA 72.34 868.08 72.36 868.32 68.66 823.92 74.50 894.00
177 Saddle 6" x 1" 6.84 - 7.45 4 EA 72.24 289.36 72.36 289.44 68.66 274.64 74.50 298.00
178 Saddle 6" X 1-1/2" 6.84 - 7.45 2 EA 82.72 165.44 82.74 165.48 78.50 157.00 85.15 170.30
179 Saddle 6"x2" 6.84 - 7.45 4 EA 90.87 363.48 90.89 363.56 86.24 344.96 93.60 374.30
180 [Saddle 8" X 3/4" 8.99 - 9.67 3 EA 89.54 268.62 89.55 268.65 84.97 254.91 92.20 276.60
181 Saddle 8" X 1" 8.99 - 9.67 8 EA 89.54 716.32 89.55 716.40 84.97 679.76 92.20 737.60
182  |Saddle 8" x 1-1/2" 8.99 - 9.67 4 EA 94.26 377.04 94.28 377.12 89.45 357.80 97.05 388.20
183 Saddle 8" x 2 8.99 - 9.67 4 EA 102.62 410.48 102.64 410.56 97.39 389.56 105.65 422.60
184 |Saddle 10" X 1" 11.04-12.12 3 EA 110.94 332.82 110.95 332.85 105.28 315.84 114.20 342.60
185 Saddle 10" X 1-1/2" 11.04 - 12.12 2 EA 120.53 241.06 121.85 243.70 115.62 231.24 125.00 250.00
186 |Saddle 10" X 2" 11.04 - 12.12 3 EA 129.45 388.35 130.87 392.61 124.17 372.51 134.70 404.10
187 U-Branch 1" Brass, No. U11-44-18 , McDonald 20 EA 81.33 1,626.60 81.34 1,626.80 77.19 1,543.80 138.30 2,766.00

—— 8,382.98 8,360.98 | rrmmkrrrmmire 7,036.51 |#ermmmkrrnnmie 9,723.50
188 Union Brass 3/4" 100 EA 5.59 559.00 7.89 789.00 6.12 612.00{No Bid No Bid
189  |Union Brass 1" 100 EA 8.40 840.00 10.46 1,046.00 8.12 812.00|No Bid No Bid
190 Union Brass 1-1/2" 20 EA 15.74 314.80 18.07 361.40 14.01 280.20(No Bid No Bid
191  |Union Brass 2" 20 EA 24.22 484.40 27.80 556.00 21.54 430.80|No Bid No Bid
192 |Valve Ball 3/4" 10 EA 4.07 40.70 6.02 60.20 5.71 57.10{No Bid No Bid
193  |Valve Ball 1" 10 EA 6.09 60.90 9.27 92.70 8.40 84.00|No Bid No Bid
194 |Valve Ball 1-1/2" 7 EA 13.89 97.23 21.76 152.32 20.79 145.53|No Bid No Bid
195 |Valve Ball 2" 12 EA 23.53 282.36 32.38 388.56 27.29 327.48|No Bid No Bid

P ——— 2,679.39 3,446.18| i 2,749.11
196  |Valve Box Extension 1", East Jordan 48 EA 17.66 847.68 17.48 839.04 16.58 795.84 6.60 316.80
197 |Valve Box Extension 1-1/2", East Jordan 48 EA 21.38 1,026.24 21.16 1,015.68 20.07 963.36 11.80 566.40
198 |Valve Box Extension 2", East Jordan 48 EA 24.16 1,159.68 23.91 1,147.68 22.68 1,088.64, 14.10 676.80
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199 |Valve Box Extension 2-1/2", East Jordan 48 EA 26.96 1,294.08 26.67 1,280.16 25.31 1,214.88 18.80 902.40
200 |Valve Box Extension 3", East Jordan 48 EA 30.16 1,472.16 30.35 1,456.80 28.80 1,382.40 21.15 1,015.20
201  [Valve Box Extension 4", East Jordan 24 EA 37.17 892.08 36.78 882.72 34.90 837.60 28.20 676.80
202 |Valve Box Extension 6", East Jordan 24 EA 48.73 1,161.52 48.74 1,169.76 46.24 1,109.76 32.90 789.60
203 [Valve Box Riser Bottom 15", Tyler 24 EA 17.40 417.60 28.80 691.20 34.03 816.72 18.90 453.60
204  |Valve Box Riser Bottom 24", Tyler 24 EA 19.96 479.04 40.80 979.20 36.64 879.36 27.50 660.00
205 [Valve Box Riser Bottom 36", Tyler 24 EA 30.52 732.48 52.00 1,248.00 47.11 1,130.64; 40.00 960.00
206 |Valve Box Riser Top 16", Tyler 24 EA 18.78 450.72 39.20 940.80 30.54 732.96 26.55 637.20
207 |Vvalve Box Riser Top 26", Tyler 24 EA 28.00 672.00 56.80 1,363.20 38.29 918.96 40.80 979.20
208 |Valve Air Rel 1" With Screen, No. D-040P01 10 EA 124.05 1,240.50 129.42 1,294.20 125.36 1,253.60 135.00 1,350.00
209 |Valve Corporation Stop, Ford, No. F1100-3-G, 3/4" 100 EA 18.29 1,829.00 17.91 1,791.00 17.36 1,736.00 18.85 1,885.00
210 |Valve Corporation Stop, Ford, No. F1100-4-G, 1" 100 EA 27.67 2,767.00 27.09 2,709.00 26.26 2,626.00 28.50 2,850.00
211 [Valve Corporation Stop, Ford No. FB1100-6-G, 1-1/2" 24 EA 71.19 1,708.56 69.69 1,672.56 67.57 1,621.68 73.30 1,759.20
212  |Valve Corporation Stop, Ford No. FB1100-7-G, 2" 12 EA 116.51 1,398.12 115.29 1,383.48 11.76 1,341.12 121.20 1,454.40
—— 19,548.46 21,864, 48] rrmckcrrmmie 20,4495 | rrmckcrrmmir 17,932.60

213  |Valve Gate 3/4", Nibco TI-8 or Equal 200 PSI 24 EA 6.38 153.12 5.12 122.88 5.74 137.76{No Bid No Bid

214 |Valve Gate 1", Nibco TI-8 or Equal 200 PSI 48 EA 8.88 426.24 6.90 331.20 7.65 367.20|No Bid No Bid

215 |Valve Gate 1-1/2", Nibco TI-8 or Equal 200 PSI 12 EA 17.18 206.16 16.89 166.68 13.99 167.88[No Bid No Bid

— 785.52 620,76 | Frrrsrrrsttnes 672.84

216 [Valve Gate 2" IP X IP, Resilient Wedge , Mueller or Equal 10 EA 214.78 2,147.80 202.78 2,027.80 204.00 2,040.00 213.40 2,134.00
217 [Valve Gate MJ X MJ X 4", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 2 EA 351.84 703.68 332.28 664.56 334.85 669.70 349.75 699.50
218 [Valve Gate 6", MIxMJ 6", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 12 EA 448.78 5,385.36 424.30 5,091.60 426.85 5,122.20 446.60 5,359.20
219 [Valve Gate FL X MJ X 6", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 3 EA 448.78 1,346.34] 424.30 1,272.90 426.85 1,280.55 446.60 1,339.80
220 |Valve Gate FL X FL X 6", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 4 EA 466.03 1,864.12 440.20 1,760.80 442.86 1,771.44 463.35 1,853.40
221  [Valve Gate MJ X MJ X 8", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 6 EA 707.23 4,243.38 675.36 4,052.16 666.85 4,001.10 710.85 4,265.10
222  |Valve Gate FL X FL X 10", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 1 EA 1,145.09 1,145.09 1,093.40 1,093.40 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,150.80 1,150.80
223 |Valve Gate MJ X MJ X 10", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 2 EA 1,102.71 2,205.42 1,053.07 2,106.14 1,059.43 2,118.86 1,108.40 2,216.80
224  |Valve Gate MJ X FL X 12", Resilient Wedge, Mueller or Equal 1 EA 1,331.32 1,331.32 1,270.75 1,271.75 1,279.43 1,279.43 1,338.50 1,338.50
225 |Valve Gate FL X FL 12", Resileint Wedge, Mueller or Equal 2 EA 1,382.54 2,765.08 1,320.60 2,641.20 1,328.57 2,657.14 1,389.95 2,779.90
P —— 23,137.59 21,982.31 | rmmmmmiiices 22,040.42| e 23,137.00
226 [Valve Main _#35 Rubber, Waterous Pacer, No. 6IWTW6735U 35 EA [No Bid No Bid 36.55 1,279.25|No Bid No Bid 34.00 1,190.00;
1,279.25 1,190.00
227 _|Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 3'.0", Mueller Super Centurion 2 EA 1,446.75 2,893.50 1,345.98 2,691.96 1,346.14 2,692.28 1,388.45 2,776.90
228 Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 3'.6", Mueller Super Centurion 3 EA 1,481.36 4,444.08 1,349.21 2,698.42 1,378.93 4,136.79 1,422.25 4,266.75
229  |Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 4'.0", Mueller Super Centurion 4 EA 1,516.08 6,064.32 1,381.29 5,525.16 1,411.71 5,646.84 1,456.05 5,824.20
230 Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 4'.6", Mueller Super Centurion 4 EA 1,550.65 6,202.60 1,419.36 5,653.44 1,444.50 5,778.00 1,489.85 5,959.40
231  |Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 5'.0", Mueller Super Centurion 4 EA 1,585.28 6,341.12 1,445.45 5,781.80 1,477.29 5,909.16 1,523.70 6,094.80
232 Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 5'.5", Mueller Super Centurion 3 EA 1,619.87 4,859.61 1,477.53 4,432.59 1,510.07 4,530.21 1,557.50 4,672.50
233 |Fire Hydrant Yellow - A423, 6'.0", Mueller 2 EA 1,654.42 3,308.84 1,541.68 3,083.36 1,542.86 3,085.72 1,722.00 3,444.00
34,114.07 29,866.73 31,779.00] 33,038.55
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