
Item          Parameter            Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Total coliform NO BID 12.00           
SM 9223B

18.00           
9223B NO BID

Colilert                                       
Bradshaw Lab/ 9223B /12.50    

12.00           
SM 9223B

12.00           
SM 9223B

40.00           
9223B QT

15.00           
SM 9223B

Colisure NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Presence-Absence 12.00           
SM 9223B

12.00           
SM 9223B

18.00           
9223B

15.00           
SM 9223B

Heterotrophic Plate Count 25.00       
Simplate 

20.00           
SM 9215B

60.00           
9215B / 9215D

15.00           
SM 9215B

Fecal coliform 25.00           
SM 9222D

15.00           
SM 9222D

25.00           
9222D

15.00           
SM 9222D

Viruses 690.00          
SM 9510

525.00          
SM 9510

525.00          
9510 NO BID

Giardia & Cryptosporidium 480.00          
SM 9711B

325.00          
SM 9711B

690.00 / 570.00   
1622 NO BID

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Alkalinity 15.00           
SM 2320B

12.00           
SM 2320B

18.00           
310.2

12.00           
SM 2320B

Cyanide (total) 40.00           
10204-00-1

35.00           
SM 4500 CN E

36.00           
9012B

27.00           
SM 4500 CNCE

Fluoride 10.00           
EPA 300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrate as N 10.00           
EPA 300.0/353.2

No Charge 18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrate + Nitrite 10.00           
EPA 300.0/353.2

15.00           
SM 4500 NO3F

24.00           
00.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrite as N 10.00           
SM 4500 NO2B

12.00           
SM 4500 NO2B

18.00           
00.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Oxygen, Dissolved 15.00           
SM 4500 OG

12.00           
SM 4500OG

20.00           
360.1

7.20            
SM 4500 OG

pH 8.00            
SM 4500 HB

8.00            
EPA 150.1

6.00            
4500 H-B

7.20            
SM 4500 H B

Sulfate 10.00           
EPA 300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Total Dissolved Solids 12.00           
SM 2540 C

12.00           
SM 2540 C

17.00           
2540 C

12.00           
SM 2540 C

Inorganic Chemistry Group 130.00 132.00 333.00 128.40

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Chloride 10.00           
EPA 300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Fluoride 10.00           
EPA 300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrate 10.00           
EPA 300.0/353.2

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrite 10.00           
SN 4500 NO2B

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

O-Phosphate 15.00           
EPA 365.3

13.00           
EPA 300.0

19.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Sulfate 10.00           
EPA 300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

ANALYTICAL BID TABULATION
DRINKING WATER

Ion Chromatography (DW)

Microbiology (DW)

Inorganics (DW)
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Ion Chromatography Group 65.00 60.00 109.00 75.60

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Alachlor 250.00          
EPA 525.2

285.00          
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

96.00           
EPA 508

Aldrin 160.00          
EPA 508.1

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Benzoa[a]pyrene See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

105.00          
EPA 525

Carbon Tetrachloride 95.00           
EPA 524.2

120.00          
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

84.00           
EPA 524

Di (2-ethylhexyl) adipate See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 525

Di (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 525

Endrin See Note        
EPA 508.1

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Heptachlor See Note        
EPA 508.1

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Heptachlor epoxide See Note        
EPA 508.1

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Hexachlorobenzene See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Hexachlorocyclopentadiene See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Methoxychlor See Note        
EPA 508.1

See Note        
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 508

Dichloromethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2 524.00 See Note        

EPA 524

Metolachlor See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2 NO BID See Note        

EPA 508

Metribuzin See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2 NO BID See Note        

EPA 508

Propachlor See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2 NO BID See Note        

EPA 508

Simazine See Note        
EPA 525.2

See Note        
EPA 525.2 NO BID See Note        

EPA 525

Organic Compounds Group 345.00 405.00 350.00 285.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Vinyl chloride 95.00           
EPA 524.2

120.00          
EPA 524.2

90.00           
524.2

84.00           
EPA 524

1, 1-Dichloroethene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Dichloromethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

trans-1, 2-Dichloroethene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

cis-1, 2-Dichloroethylene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 1, 1-Ttrichloroethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Carbon tetrachloride See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 2-Dichloroethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Organic Compounds (DW)

Volatile Organic Compounds (DW)
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Benzene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Trichloroethene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 2-Dichloropropane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Toluene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 1, 2-Trichloroethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Tetrachloroethene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Chlorobenzene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Ethylbenzene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

m, p-Xylene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

o-Xylene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Styrene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 4-Dichlorobenzene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 2-Dichlorobenzene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

1, 2, 4-Trichlorobenzene See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Xylenes (total) See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Chloroform 45.00           
EPA 524.2

60.00           
EPA 524.2

72.00           
524.2

48.00           
EPA 524

Bromodichloromethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Dibromochloromethane See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

Bromoform See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524.2

See Note        
EPA 524

TTHM Group 45.00 60.00 72.00 48.00

VOC Group 95.00 120.00 90.00 84.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Antimony 6.00            
EPA 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Arsenic 6.00            
EPA 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.8

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Beryllium 6.00            
EPA 200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.9

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Cadmium 6.00            
EPA 200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.10

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Calcium Hardness CALC-NO CHARGE   
EPA 200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.11

6.00            
SM 2340B

Calcium 6.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.12

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Chromium 6.00            
EPA 200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.13

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Metals (DW)
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Copper 6.00            
EPA 200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.14

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Lead 6.00            
EPA 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.15

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Magnesium Hardness CALC-NO CHARGE   
EPA 200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.16

6.00            
SM 2340B

Magnesium 6.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.17

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Nickel 6.00            
EPA 200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.18

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Selenium 6.00            
EPA 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.19

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Sodium 6.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.20

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Thallium 6.00            
EPA 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.21

8.50 / 12.00     
EPA 200.7  200.8

Total Hardness CALC-NO CHARGE   
EPA 200.7

16.00           
EPA 200.7

8.00            
VARIES

6.00            
SM 2340B

Total Metals Group 78.00 128.00 128.00 98.70

Metals by ICP Group 18? 56.00 8? 66.30

Metals by ICP/MS Group 60.00 72.00 12? 72.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Gross Alpha 51.00           
600/00-02

60.00           
EPA 600/00-02

60.00           
600/00-02

56.00           
EPA 900

Gross Beta 34.00           
900

60.00           
EPA 900.0

60.00           
900.0

56.00           
EPA 900

Radium 226 79.00           
903.1

90.00           
EPA 903

90.00           
903.0

88.00           
EPA 903.1

Radium 228 102.00          
904

130.00          
EPA 904

130.00          
904.0

132.00          
EPA 904

Radon 222 62.00           
7500 RN

70.00           
EPA 7500-RN NO BID 70.00           

EPA 7500 RN

Total Radium 181.00          
903.1 / 904

220.00          
EPA 903/904

220.00          
NO METHOD

182.00          
EPA 903.1

Cesium 153.00          
901.1

176.00          
EPA 901.1 NO BID 153.00          

EPA 901.1

Iodine 153.00          
901.1

177.00          
EPA 901.1 NO BID 155.00          

EPA 901.1

Strontium 159.00          
00-004

175.00          
EPA 905

175.00          
905

164.00          
EPA 00-004

Tritium 77.00           
906

85.00           
EPA 906

85.00           
906

85.00           
EPA 906

Uranium 14.00 / 153.00  
200.8 / 908.0

12.00           
EPA 200.8

170.00          
EPA 00-07

118.00          
EPA 908

Gamma Emitting Isotopes 153.00          
901.1

175.00          
EPA 901.1 NO BID 170.00          

EPA 901.1

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

EPA 527 175.00          
527

225.00          EPA 
527 NO BID 300.00          EPA 

527

EPA 529 175.00          
529

225.00          EPA 
529 NO BID 230.00          EPA 

529

Radiochemistry (DW)

UCMR 2 Assessment Monitoring (DW)

UCMR 2 Screening Survey (DW)
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Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

EPA 521 200.00          
521

325.00          EPA 
521 NO BID 845.00          EPA 

521

EPA 525.2 150.00          
525.2

285.00          EPA 
525.2

350.00          
525.2

300.00          EPA 
525.2

EPA 535 300.00          
535

350.00          EPA 
535 NO BID 425.00          EPA 

535

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Monochloroacetic Acid 85.00           
552.2

120.00          EPA 
552.2

250.00          
552.2

115.50          EPA 
552

Dichloroacetic Acid See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552.2

See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552

Trichloroacetic Acid See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552.2

See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552

Monobromoacetic Acid See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552.2

See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552

Dibromoacetic Acid See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552.2

See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552

HAA5 See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552.2

See Note        
552.2

See Note        
EPA 552

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

EPA 100.1 Group 110.00          
101.1

117.00          EPA 
101.1

NO BID 108.00          TEM

EPA 504.1 Group 60.00           
504.1

85.00           
EPA 504.1

72.00             504 54.00           
EPA 504

EPA 515.3 Group 140.00          
515.3

175.00          
EPA 515.3

200.00          
515

102.00          
EPA 515

EPA 525.2 Group 250.00          
525.2

285.00          
EPA 525.2

350.00          
525.2

105.00          
EPA 525

EPA 547 Group 170.00          
547

90.00           
EPA 547

180.00          
547

90.00           
EPA 547

EPA 548.1 Group 160.00          
548.1

140.00          
EPA 548.1

180.00          
548

90.00           
EPA 548

EPA 549.2 Group 170.00          
549.2

140.00          
EPA 549.2

180.00          
549

90.00           
EPA 549

EPA1613 -Tetras 325.00          
1613

325.00          
EPA 1613

650.00          
1613

90.00           
EPA 1613

Langelier Index 10.00           
LANGELIER

40.00           
VARIES

58.00        
CORROSIVITY

CALC          
EPA 2330

Pesticides / PCBS-505 160.00          
508

150.00          
EPA 505

200.00          
505

96.00           
EPA 508

ANALYTICAL BID TABULATION

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Haloacetic Acids by Gas Chromatography (GC) (DW)

 Other Drinking Water Methods (DW)

Microbiology (WW)

WASTEWATER
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Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Fecal coliform NO BID 15.00           
SM 9222D

25.00           
9222D NO BID

Multiple Tube Fermentation NO BID 30.00           
SM 9221E NO BID 36.00           

SM 9221E

Membrane Filter 20.00           
SM 9222D

15.00           
SM 9222D

25.00           
9222D

15.00           
SM 9222D

Total coliform NO BID 16.00           
SM 9222B

18.00           
9223B NO BID

Multi Tube Fermentation 48.00           
SM 9221B

30.00           
SM 9221B NO BID 36.00           

SM 9221B

Membrane Filter NO BID 16.00           
SM 9222B NO BID NO BID

Fecal Streptococcus NO BID 30.00           
SM 9230B NO BID NO BID

Multi Tube Fermentation 48.00           
SM 9230B

30.00           
SM 9230B NO BID 21.00           

SM 9230B

Membrane Filter NO BID NO BID 40.00           
9230C NO BID

E-Coli 20.00           
SM 9223B

18.00           
SM 9223B

40.00           
9223B QT

15.00           
SM 9221F

Viruses 690.00          
SM 9510

525.00          
SM 9510

525.00          
SM 9510 NO BID

Giardia and Cryptosporidium 480.00          
SM 9711B

325.00          
SM 9711B

690.00 / 570.00 
1022 / 1622 NO BID

Ascaris Lumbricoides 180.00          
SM 10550

100.00          
SM 10550

150.00          
SM 10550 NO BID

Common Tapeworm 240.00 / 90.00    
SM10550-MICRO.

100.00          
SM 10550

200.00          
SM 10550 NO BID

Entamoeba Histolytica 690.00          
SM 9711C

325.00          
SM 9711C

375.00          
SM 9711C NO BID

Filamentous Organism ID 90.00           
Microscopy

150.00          
Microscopy

75.00 / HOUR    
VARIES NO BID

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Nitrogen as NH3 (Ammonia) 25.00           
350.1

19.00           
EPA 350.1

24.00           
350.1

12.60           
SM 4500 NH3D

Nitrogen as NO3 (Nitrate) 10.00           
353.2/300.0 CALC 18.00           

300.0
12.60           

EPA 300.0

Nitrogen as NO2 (Nitrite) 10.00           
SM 4500 NO2 B

12.00           
SM 4500 NO2 B

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrogen as Norg  (TKN) 25.00           
351.2

30.00           
EPA 351.2

24.00           
351.2

27.00           
4500 NORGC

Nitrogen, Total (calc) NO CHARGE    
CALC

45.00           
CALC

NO CHARGE    
CALC

NO CHARGE    
CALC

Total Nitrogen Group 70.00 76.00 84.00 64.80

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Alkalinity 15.00           
SM 2320B

12.00           
SM 2330B

18.00           
310.2

12.00           
SM 2320B

Ammonia 25.00           
350.1

19.00           
EPA350.1

24.00           
350.1

12.60           
SM 4500 NH3 D

Boron 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7  200.8

Calcium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7  200.8

Chloride 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrogen (WW)

 Inorganics  (WW)
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Fluoride 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
SM4500 FC

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrate as N 10.00           
SM 353.2 / 300.0 CALC 18.00           

300.0
12.60           

EPA 300.0

Nitrite as N 10.00           
SM 4500 NO2B

12.00           
SM 4500 NO2 B

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Nitrate and Nitrite as N 20.00           
353.2

15.00           
SM4500 NO3F

24.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Potassium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7  200.8

Sodium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7  200.8

Sulfate 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Total Dissolved Solids 12.00           
SM 2540 C

12.00           
SM 2540 C

17.00           
2540 C

12.00           
SM 2540 C

Inorganic (IOC) Group 126.00 141.00 205.00 146.20

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Biochemical Oxygen Demand 34.00           
SM 5210B

28.00           
SM 5210B

30.00           
SM 5210B

30.00           
SM 5210B

Chemical Oxygen Demand 24.00           
HACH 8000

28.00           
410.4

24.00           
410.4

24.00           
SM 5220

Total Organic Carbon 35.00           
SM 5310C

34.00           
SM 52310C

24.00           
5310B

24.00           
SM 5310B

Dissolved Organic Halogen 90.00           
9020B NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aquatic Humic Substances 185.00          
SM 5510C NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oil and Grease 55.00           
1664A

55.00           
EPA 1664A

54.00          
1664A

36.00           
EPA 1664

Phenols 65.00           
420.1

70.00           
EPA 420.1

54.00           
420.1

27.00           
EPA 420.1

Tannin and Lignin 30.00           
SM 5550B NO BID NO BID NO BID

Organic and Volatile Acids 155.00          
CAS SOP NO BID NO BID NO BID

Trihalomethane (Formation) 250.00          
SM 5710B

200.00          
SM 5710B NO BID NO BID

UV- Absorbing Organics 200.00          
SM 5910

50.00           
SM 5910B NO BID NO BID

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Alachlor 110.00          
508 / 8081

260.00          
EPA 625

350.00          
625

108.00          
EPA 608

Aldrin See Note        
508 / 608 / 8081

160.00          
EPA 608

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 608

Benzoa[a]pyrene 175.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625

350.00          
625

165.00          
EPA 625

Carbon Tetrachloride 95.00           
624

120.00          
EPA 624

350.00          
625

84.00           
EPA 624

Dichloromethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

350.00          
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Di (2-ethylhexyl) adipate 250.00          
525.2

See Note        
EPA 625

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Di (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
EPA 625

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Aggregate Organic Constituents (WW)

Organic Chemicals (WW)
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Endrin See Note        
508 / 608 / 8081

See Note        
EPA 608

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 608

Heptachlor See Note        
508 / 608 / 8081

See Note        
EPA 608

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 608

Heptachlor epoxide See Note        
508 / 608 / 8081

See Note        
EPA 608

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 608

Hexachlorobenzene See Note.00     
525.2 / 625

See Note        
EPA 625

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Hexachlorocyclopentadiene See Note.00     
525.2 / 625

See Note        
EPA 625

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Lindane See Note        
508 / 608 / 8081

See Note        
EPA 625

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 608

Methoxychlor See Note        
508 / 608 / 8081

See Note        
EPA 608

350.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 608

Metolachlor See Note        
525.2 NO BID 350.00          

625
See Note        
EPA 608

Metribuzin See Note        
525.2 NO BID 350.00          

625
See Note        
EPA 608

Propachlor See Note        
525.2 NO BID 350.00          

625 NO BID

Simazine See Note        
525.2

625            
EPA 525.2

350.00          
625 NO BID

Organic Chemicals Group 345.00 540.00 350.00 357.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Benzene 95.00           
624

120.00          
EPA 624

90.00           
624

84.00           
EPA 624

Bromoform See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Bromodichloromenthane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Carbon Tetrachloride See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Chloroform See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Dibromochloromethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

o-Dichlorobenzene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

para-Dichlorobenzene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

1, 2-Dichloroethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

1, 1-Dichloroethylene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

cis -1, 2- Dichloroethylene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

trans-1, 2-Dichloroethylene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Dichloromethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

1, 2-Dichloropropane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Ethylbenzene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Hexachlorobenzene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 625

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Volatile Organic Compounds (WW)

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 
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Monochlorobenzene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Styrene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Tetrachloroethylene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Tolulene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Trihalomethanes (Total) See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

1, 1, 1-Trichloroethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

1, 2, 4-Trichlorobenzene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

1, 1, 2-Trichloroethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Trichloroethylene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Vinyl Chloride See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Xylenes (Total) See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

90.00           
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Volatile (VOC) Group 95.00 120.00 90.00 84.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America
Acrolein, Acrylonitrile and 2 
CEVE

60.00           
624

60.00           
EPA 624

280.00          
624

84.00           
EPA 624

Semi-volatile (8270) 175.00          
625 / 8270

290.00          
EPA 8270C

375.00          
8270

165.00          
EPA 8270

Chlorobenzene 95.00           
624

120.00          
EPA 624

220.00          
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Chloroethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

2-Chloroethyl Vinyl Either See Note        
624

60.00           
EPA 624 NO BID See Note        

EPA 624

1,3-Dichloropropene See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Ethylbenzenza See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Methyl Bromide See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624 NO BID See Note        

EPA 624

Methyl Chloride See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624 NO BID See Note        

EPA 624

Methylene Chloride See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624 NO BID See Note        

EPA 624

1,1,2,2-Tetrachloroethane See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

See Note        
624

See Note        
EPA 624

Phenols 105.00          
625

70.00           
EPA 625 EPA 625 108.00          

EPA 625

Benzidines 105.00          
625

160.00          
EPA 625 NO BID 165.00          

EPA 625

Phthalate Esters 105.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625 NO BID 165.00          

EPA 625

Nitrosamines 200.00          
521

See Note        
EPA 625 NO BID 165.00          

EPA 625
Organochlorine Pesticides & 
PCBs (608)

110.00          
608

See Note        
EPA 625

200.00          
608

108.00          
EPA 608

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Other Volatile Organic Compounds  (WW)

2/26/2010 Page 9 of 16



Nitro aromatics and 
Isophorone NO BID See Note        

EPA 625 NO BID 165.00          
EPA 625

PAH 125.00          
610 / 8310

130.00          
EPA 8310

120.00          
8310

84.00           
EPA 610

Halo ethers NO BID See Note        
EPA 625 NO BID 165.00          

EPA 625

Chlorinated Hydrocarbons 65.00           
624

130.00          
EPA 8260B

100.00          
8015B

132.00          
EPA  8151

2,3,7,8,TCDD (Dioxin) 325.00          
1613 / 9290

425.00          
EPA 1613

900.00          
1613

650.00          
EPA  1613

625 Dioxin Screen 95.00           
625

See Note        
EPA 625

528.00          
1613

180.00          
EPA 625

Tetra-Octa Chlorinated Dioxins 
& Furans 

545.00          
1613 / 82.90

900.00          
EPA 1613 NO BID 650.00          

EPA 1613

Triazine Pesticides NO BID See Note        
EPA 608 MOD NO BID NO BID

Base/Neutral & Acids (625 or 
1625)

175.00          
625

See Note        
EPA 625

390.00          
625

275.00          
EPA 625

Carbamates and Urea 
Pesticides

180.00          
531.1

120.00          
EPA 531.2 NO BID NO BID

TPH 55.00           
1664A / 8015AZ

55.00           
EPA 1664A

72.00           
8015

36.00           
EPA  1664

Ethylene Glycol 135.00          
8015

120.00         
EPA 8015 MOD

375.00          
NO METHOD

65.00           
EPA  8015

Organophosphorus Pesticides 210.00          
8151A

230.00          
EPA 1657

230.00          
1657

120.00          
EPA  8141

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Alachlor 110.00          
608

160.00          
EPA 608 NO BID 84.00           

EPA 608

Aldrin See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Chlordane See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

DDD See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

DDE See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

DDT See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Dieldrin See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Endosulfan-Beta See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Endosulfan sulfate See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Endrin See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Endrin Aldehyde See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Heptachlor See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Heptachlor Epoxide See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Hexachlorocyclohexane-alfa See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Hexachlorocyclohexane-beta See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Pesticides (WW)

2/26/2010 Page 10 of 16



Hexachlorocyclohexane-
gamma

See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

PCB-1242 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

140.00          
8082

60.00           
EPA 608

PCB-1254 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 608

PCB-1221 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 608

PCB-1232 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 608

PCB-1248 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 608

PCB-1260 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 608

PCB-1016 See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608

See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 608

Toxaphene See Note        
608

See Note        
EPA 608 NO BID See Note        

EPA 608

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

2-Chlorophenol 105.00          
625

260.00          
EPA 625

390.00          
625

108.00          
EPA 625

4-Chloro-3-Methyl Phenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

2,4-Dichlorophenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

2,4-Dimethylphenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

2,4-Dinittrophenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

4,6-Dinitro-o-Phenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

2-Nitrophenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

4-Nitrophenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Phenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Pentachlorophenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

2,4,6-Trichlorophenol See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

See Note        
625

See Note        
EPA 625

Acid Compound Group 105.00 260.00 390.00 108.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Alkalinity 15.00           
SM 2320B

12.00           
SM 2320B

18.00           
310.2

12.00           
SM 2320B

Chloride 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
SM 4500 CLB

18.00           
300

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Calcium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Iron 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Magnesium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Acid Compounds (WW)

Indicator Major Cations / Anions (WW)
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Manganese 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Potassium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Sodium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Sulfate 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300.0

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Total Dissolved Solids 12.00           
SM 2540C

12.00           
SM2540C

17.00           
2540C

12.00           
SM2540C

Total Organic Carbon 35.00           
SM 5310C

34.00           
SM5310C

24.00           
5310B

24.00           
SM5210B

Indicator Group 118.00 132.00 143.00 124.20

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

2 Aluminum 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Antimony 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Arsenic 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Barium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Beryllium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Bismuth 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Boron 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Cadmium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Calcium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Chromium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

2 Chromium (III) CALC          
NO CHARGE CALC 63.00           

NO METHOD
7.20            

EPA 200.7

2 Chromium (VI) 25.00           
SM 3500 CR D

25.00           
SM 3500 CR D

50.00           
NO METHOD

24.00           
SM 3500 CR D

Cobalt 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

2 Copper 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1 Cyanide (Free) 40.00           
SM 4500 CNG

35.00           
SM 4500 CNE

55.00           
NO METHOD

27.00           
SM 4500 CNCE

1 Fluoride 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
SM 4500 FC

20.00           
NO METHOD

12.60           
EPA 300.0

Gallium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Germanium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Gold 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

40.00           
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Indium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID NO BID

Iridium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID NO BID

Iron 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Metals (WW)
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1,2 Lead 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Lithium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Magnesium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

12.00           
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Manganese 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

12.00           
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Mercury 24.00           
245.1

28.00           
EPA 245.1

24.00           
245.1

24.00           
EPA 245

2 Molybdenum 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

1,2 Nickel 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Osmium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID NO BID

Palladium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Phenols (total) 80.00           
420.1

70.00           
EPA 420.1 NO BID 27.00           

EPA 420.1

Platinum 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Potassium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Rhodium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID NO BID

Ruthenium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID NO BID

1,2 Selenium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Silicon 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

2 Silver 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Sodium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Strontium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.8

12.00           
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Tellurium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

1,2 Thallium 6.00            
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Thorium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8 NO BID NO BID

Tin 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

Titanium 50.00           
200.7 / 200.8

8.00            
EPA 200.7 NO BID 8.50            

EPA 200.7

2 Total Phenols 80.00           
420.1

70.00           
EPA 420.1 NO BID 27.00           

EPA 420.1

Uranium 6.00            
200.8

12.00           
EPA 200.8

120.00          
EPA 00-07 NO BID

Vanadium 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Zinc 6.00            
200.7

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7

8.50            
EPA 200.7

Metals Group 1 134.00 180.00 230.00 110.50

Metals Group 2 213.00 243.00 NO BID 161.50
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Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

TCLP Metals (8 RCRA) 74.00           
1311/6010B/7471A

134.00          
6010B / 7470A

251.00          
6010B / 7470A

108.00          
1311 / 6010

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Aluminum 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Cadmium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Calcium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Chromium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Copper 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Iron 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Magnesium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Manganese 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Mercury 24.00           
7471A

28.00           
EPA 7471A

8.00            
200.7 

24.00           
EPA 7471A

Molybdenum 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Nickel 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Potassium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Selenium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Sodium 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Zinc 6.00            
6010B

8.00            
EPA 200.7

8.00            
200.7 

8.50            
EPA 6010

Percent Solids 8.00            
SM 2540G

12.00           
EPA 160.3 NO BID 9.00            

SM 2540G

Ammonia-N 27.00           
350.1 MOD

19.00           
EPA 350.1

24.00           
350.1D

12.60           
SM 4500 NH3 D

Nitrate-N 12.00           
353.2 MOD CALC 18.00           

300.1
12.60           

EPA 9056

Nitrite-N 12.00           
SM 4500 NO2B

12.00           
SM 4500 NO2B

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

Nitrogen-Total
CALC NO CHARGE   

353.2 + 351.2
45.00           

VARIOUS
24.00           
300.0 CALC

Phosphorous-Total ( P) 17.00           
365.3M

20.00           
EPA 365.3

60.00           
365.2

24.00           
SM 4500 P B E

Total Kjeldahl Nitrogen 27.00           
351.2M

30.00           
EPA 351.2

24.00           
351.2

45.00           
SM4500NORG C

pH 10.00           
9045D

8.00            
EPA 9045D

6.00            
4500HB

7.20            
EPA 9045D

Temperature-Deg C NO CHARGE N/A            
NO CHARGE

6.0             
NO METHOD N/A

Nitrogen-Organic NO CHARGE 49.00           
VARIOUS

24.00           
351.2 CALC

TCLP Metals (WW)

Biosolids (WW)
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Aroclor 1016 CALC NO CHARGE   
351.2 / 350.1

120.00          
EPA 8082 NO BID 60.00           

EPA 8082

Aroclor 1221 80.00           
8082

See Note        
EPA 8082 NO BID See Note        

EPA 8082

Aroclor 1232 See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 8082 NO BID See Note        

EPA 8082

Aroclor 1242 See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 8082 NO BID See Note        

EPA 8082

Aroclor 1248 See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 8082 NO BID See Note        

EPA 8082

Aroclor 1254 See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 8082 NO BID See Note        

EPA 8082

Aroclor 1260 See Note        
8082

See Note        
EPA 8082 NO BID See Note        

EPA 8082

Biosolids Group 301.00 447.00 NO BID 326.00

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Chloride 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

Fluoride 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

Nitrate 10.00           
353.2 / 300.0

13.00           
EPA 300

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

Nitrite 10.00           
SM 4500 NO2B

13.00           
EPA 300

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

O-Phosphate 15.00           
365.3

13.00           
EPA 300

19.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

Sulfate 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

Ion Chromatography Group 65.00 60.00 109.00 75.60

Item Parameter Columbia Legend Nortest Test America

Algae Identification 120.00      
MICORSCOPY

75.00           
MICROSCOPY

95.00         
MICROSCOPY NO BID

Flash Point 30.00           
1010A

25.00           
EPA 1010

24.00           
D93 / 1010A

20.40           
EPA 1010

MIB/Geosmin NO BID 250.00       
GC/MS NO BID NO BID

NDMA 200.00          
521

260.00          
EPA 625 NO BID NO BID

Endocrine Disruptors 2000.00         
NO METHOD

390.00          
L 200 NO BID NO BID

TOX 90.00           
9020B

90.00           
EPA 9075

84.00           
5320B

66.00           
EPA 9020/9076

Sulfides 20.00           
HACH 8131

20.00           
SM 4500 S2CD

18.00           
4500-S2D

18.00           
EPA 376.2

Sulfate 10.00           
300.0

13.00           
EPA 300

18.00           
300.0

12.60           
EPA 9056

TOC 35.00           
SM 5310C

34.00           
SM 5231 0C

24.00           
5310B

24.00           
EPA 9060A

Phenolics 65.00           
420.1

160.00          
EPA 625

24.00           
420.1

27.00           
EPA 9065

Note:  Price is for the method as a group and is only listed once. 

Miscellaneous (WW)

Ion Chromatography
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Oil and Grease 55.00           
1664A

55.00           
EPA 1664A

54.00           
1664A

36.00           
EPA 1664

Bromide 10.00           
300.0

25.00           
EPA 300

24.00           
300

12.60           
EPA 9056
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