
 
Bid Tabulation 

Wastewater Treatment  
Trojan 3000 UV Lamps and Quartz Sleeves 

 
 

Greg Ellner Associates, LTD               33 Sunset Ridge, Carmel, New York 10512 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- 

2 Year Life Lamps 128 $107.00 $13,696.00 $1,040.90 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $13,696.00 $14,736.90 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $38.50 $4,928.00 $374.53 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $4,928.00 $5,302.53 

 
 

Emperor Aquatics Inc.              2229 Sanatoga Station Road, Pottstown, Pennsylvania 19464 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps 128 $93.75 $12,000.00 $912.00 
(Not included in bid) 

$118.00 $12,000.00 $13,030.00 

2 Year Life Lamps 128 $118.75 $15,200.00 $1,155.20 
(Not included in bid) 

$118.00 $15,200.00 $16,473.20 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $35.00 $4,480.00 $340.48 
(Not included in bid) 

$118.00 $4,480.00 $4,938.00 
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Innovative ARC Tubes Corp.              12440 Central Avenue, Bridgeport, Connecticut 06607 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps 128 $78.00 $9,984.00 $758.78 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $9,984.00 $10,742.78 

2 Year Life Lamps 128 $156.00 $19,968.00 $1,517.57 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $19,968.00 $21,485.57 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $46.50 $5,592.00 $424.99 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $5,592.00 $6,016.99 

 
 

Radiant Industrial Solutions         4248 Bluebonnet Drive, Stafford, Texas 77477 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps 128 $110.00 $14,080.00 $1,070.08 
(Not included in bid) 

$120.00 $14,080.00 $15,270.08 

2 Year Life Lamps No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $46.00 $5,888.00 $447.49 
(Not included in bid) 

$120.00 $5,888.00 $6,455.49 

 
 

UV Doctor Lamps LLC         4082 Bead Lake Road, Newport, Washington, 99156 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps 128 $117.33 $15,018.24 $1,141.39 
(Not included in bid) 

$150.00 $15,018.24 $16,309.63 

2 Year Life Lamps No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $53.77 $6,882.56 $523.07 
(Not included in bid) 

$150.00 $6,882.56 $7,555.63 
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Bulbtronics, Inc.                    45 Banfi Plaza, Farmingdale, New York 11735 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps 128 $62.00 $7,936.00 $603.14 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $7,936.00 $8,539.14 

2 Year Life Lamps No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $49.00 $6,272.00 $476.67 
(Not included in bid) 

Included $6,272.00 $6,748.67 

 
 

DC Frost Associates, Inc.      2855 Mitchell Drive, #215, Walnut Creek, California 94598 

Item Quantity Unit Cost Subtotal Tax Freight Bid Actual Total 

1 Year Life Lamps 128 $204.00 $26,112.00 $1,984.51 
(Not included in bid) 

$350.00 $26,112.00 $28,446.51 

2 Year Life Lamps No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- 

Quartz Sleeves 128 $82.00 $10,496.00 $797.70 
(Not included in bid) 

$350.00 $10,496.00 $11,643.70 

 
 

SUMMARY 
 

Item Greg Ellner Emperor 
Aquatics 

Innovative 
ARC 

Radiant 
Industrial 

UV Doctor Bulbtronics DC Frost 

1 Year Life Lamps No Bid $13,030.00 $10,742.78 $15,270.08 $16,309.63 $8,539.14 $28,446.51 

2 Year Life Lamps $14,736.90 $16,473.20 $21,485.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Quartz Sleeves $5,302.53 $4,938.00 $6,016.99 $6,455.49 $7,555.63 $6,748.67 $11,643.70 

 


